## MIDDLE SCHOOL RENOVATIONS COCALICO SCHOOL DISTRICT

## compiled by AEM ARCHITECTS, INC.

CONTRACT #3 - HVAC CONSTRUCTION		
MYCO Mechanical	Boro Construction	Tri-County Mechanical
\$8,674,000.00	\$8,548,000.00	No Bid
+\$2,400,000.00	+\$2,450,000.00	No Bid
+\$2,500,000.00	+\$2,550,000.00	No Bid
+\$3,000,000.00	No Bid	No Bid
+\$3,000,000.00	No Bid	No Bid
	MYCO Mechanical \$8,674,000.00 +\$2,400,000.00 +\$2,500,000.00 +\$3,000,000.00	MYCO Mechanical Boro Construction   \$8,674,000.00 \$8,548,000.00   \$8,674,000.00 \$8,548,000.00   +\$2,400,000.00 \$8,548,000.00   +\$2,500,000.00 +\$2,550,000.00   +\$3,000,000.00 No Bid